

**BQCM Case 3525 - 15/01/2020 - Animal Welfare Summary Report**

Report Run Date 21/01/2021 03:55:55 PM

FOR INTERNAL USE ONLY**Summary**

A horse with arthritis in both front legs.
A second horse carrying its right front leg.
Both horses unable to walk on their own by bearing weight on all legs.
Suffering from conditions that are likely to increase pain and suffering as a result of the transport process.
Showing visible signs of severe injury or distress.

Case Start Date	15/01/2020 12:00:00 AM
Priority	Critical
Source	Commonwealth
Status	Closed - Investigation Complete
Zone	South East
Case Manager	TEWS Jason
Delegated Zone Leader / Policy Officer	RAWSON Gavin
Investigating Officer	MOWETT Peter; RAWSON Gavin
Case PIC	
Address	Old Gympie Road
Locality	Caboolture
LGA	Moreton Bay
From PIC	
Investigation Comments	
Related Incidents	5271 - 13/12/2019 - Animal Welfare;
Location Notes	

Actions

Action	Action Details	Action Document	Action Due Date	Issuing Officer	Action Status
--------	----------------	-----------------	-----------------	-----------------	---------------



BQCM Case 3525 - 15/01/2020 - Animal Welfare Summary Report

Report Run Date 21/01/2021 03:55:55 PM

FOR INTERNAL USE ONLY

Outcomes	
Outcome	Outcome Details
Advisory letter;	Sent ordinary mail on 4/3 /20

Allegations					
Act	Offence	Other	Start Date	End Date	Comments

Customers						
Full Name	Address	Contact Details	Customer Type	WHS Issues	Responsibility to Animal	Case Customer Comments
sch4p4(6) Personal information			Person of Interest	None identified;	sch4p4(6) Personal information	
			Person of Interest	None identified;		
			Person of Interest	Unknown;		
Sch4p3(13), Sch4p3(16)						

Subject					
Subject	Problem	Other Problem	Biomatter Type	Number	Category
Animal	Lameness;		Horse	2	Domestic/Companion



BQCM Case 3525 - 15/01/2020 - Animal Welfare Summary Report

Report Run Date 21/01/2021 03:55:55 PM

FOR INTERNAL USE ONLY

Case Interactions

No	Interaction Date Time	Interaction Type	Interaction Details	Duration	Powers Exercised	Staff Member	Evidence
1	04/03/2020 08:00:00 AM	Review of Investigation documents	Attend to advisory letter	2.00		Gavin Rawson	Advisory letter
2	02/03/2020 04:45:00 PM	Review of Investigation documents	Feedback provided to stakeholders. GDR 5	0.50		Gavin Rawson	

Published on DAF Disclosure Log
RTI Act 2009



BQCM Case 3525 - 15/01/2020 - Animal Welfare Summary Report

Report Run Date 21/01/2021 03:55:55 PM

FOR INTERNAL USE ONLY

3	02/03/2020 04:15:00 PM	Review of Investigation documents	There is insufficient evidence to substantiate a breach of Section 18 of the ACPA relating to fitness to travel. <div data-bbox="492 391 1388 1468" style="border: 1px solid red; min-height: 675px; display: flex; align-items: center; justify-content: center;"><p data-bbox="470 917 1500 949">sch4p4(6) Personal information, sch4p3(6), Information relating to investigations and methods of procedures</p></div>	0.75	Gavin Rawson	
---	---------------------------	---	--	------	--------------	--

Published on DAF Disclosure Log
RTI Act 2009

BQCM Case 3525 - 15/01/2020 - Animal Welfare Summary Report

Report Run Date 21/01/2021 03:55:55 PM

FOR INTERNAL USE ONLY

			Given this information there is insufficient evidence to substantiate a breach of the Act and this matter is finalised. This matter can be the subject to an advisory letter.			
4	21/01/2020 12:00:00 PM	Internal meetings	<p>Information relating to investigations and methods of procedures</p> <p style="font-size: 2em; opacity: 0.5; transform: rotate(-45deg); position: absolute; top: 50%; left: 50%;">Published on DAF Disclosure Log RTI Act 2009</p>	0.50	Gavin Rawson	
5	21/01/2020 10:50:00 AM	Phone call		2.50	Peter Mowett	Meeting 6 Personal information 21.1.2020
6	21/01/2020 08:05:00 AM	Email		0.50	Gavin Rawson	
7	17/01/2020 01:30:00 PM	Email		0.50	Gavin Rawson	
8	15/01/2020 05:05:00 PM	Review of Investigation documents		1.00	Gavin Rawson	
9	15/01/2020 04:35:00 PM	Internal meetings		1.00	Gavin Rawson; Peter Mowett	
10	15/01/2020 03:50:00 PM	Email		0.75	Gavin Rawson	Email 2



BQCM Case 3525 - 15/01/2020 - Animal Welfare Summary Report

Report Run Date 21/01/2021 03:55:55 PM

FOR INTERNAL USE ONLY

Case Interactions

No	Interaction Date Time	Interaction Type	Interaction Details	Duration	Powers Exercised	Staff Member	Evidence
11	15/01/2020 03:30:00 PM	Review of Investigation documents	<div style="border: 1px solid red; padding: 20px; text-align: center;">Information relating to investigations and methods of procedures</div>	1.00		Gavin Rawson	

Published on DAF Disclosure Log
RTI Act 2009



BQCM Case 3525 - 15/01/2020 - Animal Welfare Summary Report

Report Run Date 21/01/2021 03:55:55 PM

FOR INTERNAL USE ONLY

Case Interactions

No	Interaction Date Time	Interaction Type	Interaction Details	Duration	Powers Exercised	Staff Member	Evidence
12	15/01/2020 03:10:00 PM	Review of Investigation documents	Information relating to investigations and methods of procedures	1.00		Gavin Rawson	

Published on DAF Disclosure Log
RTI Act 2009



BQCM Case 3525 - 15/01/2020 - Animal Welfare Summary Report

Report Run Date 21/01/2021 03:55:55 PM

FOR INTERNAL USE ONLY

Case Interactions							
No	Interaction Date Time	Interaction Type	Interaction Details	Duration	Powers Exercised	Staff Member	Evidence
13	15/01/2020 02:50:00 PM	Review of Investigation documents	<p>Information relating to investigations and methods of procedures</p> <p><i>Published on DAF Disclosure Log RTI Act 2009</i></p>	1.00		Gavin Rawson	
14	21/12/2019 11:50:00 AM	Email		0.25		Gavin Rawson	
15	20/12/2019 03:05:00 PM	Email		0.25		Gavin Rawson	Exhibit 3
16	17/12/2019 03:20:00 PM	Email		1.00		Gavin Rawson	Exhibit 2
17	17/12/2019 10:30:00 AM	Review of Investigation documents		3.00		Gavin Rawson	Exhibit 1



BQCM Case 3525 - 15/01/2020 - Animal Welfare Summary Report

Report Run Date 21/01/2021 03:55:55 PM

FOR INTERNAL USE ONLY

Case Interactions							
No	Interaction Date Time	Interaction Type	Interaction Details	Duration	Powers Exercised	Staff Member	Evidence
18	13/12/2019 07:00:00 AM	Phone call	Information relating to investigations and methods of procedures	1.50		Gavin Rawson	
Total Duration				19.00			
Total Interactions				18			

Related Incident Interactions						
No	Interaction Date /Time	Interaction Type	Interaction Details	Duration	Staff Member	Incident ID
1	09/01/2020	Email	Email to Gav Rawson 9 1 20 confirming LSU handling this investigation	0.10	WILLETT Paul	5271
Total Interactions 1				0.10		

Related Incident Documents	
Attachments	Incident ID
sch4p4(6) Personal information, Information relating to investigations and methods of procedures	5271
	5271
	5271
	5271



Department of Agriculture and Fisheries

BQCM Case 3525 - 15/01/2020 - Animal Welfare Summary Report

Report Run Date 21/01/2021 03:55:55 PM

FOR INTERNAL USE ONLY

Related Incident Assessments

No	Incident Outcome	Duration	Incident ID
1	Investigation required	30.00	5271
		30.00	
		Total Case Duration	49.10

Published on DAF Disclosure Log
RTI Act 2009